
Triple Tier Series – Wall Mount GS-126W 
Product Description 

The Gama Sonic Triple Tier GS-126W solar light fixture is a modern outdoor LED wall light 
that adds distinction to your home, shed, barn, greenhouse, storage unit, or garage. 

The rust-resistant cast-aluminum light fixture sports a matte white powder-coated finish. Its 
circular wall bracket, measuring 5.5 inches in diameter, mounts easily on any surface, and no 
electrical wiring is required. 

No Electrical Wiring: It requires no electrical wiring for installation, making it the perfect 
replacement for outdated electric or gas-powered outdoor lighting 

Solar Powered: Our Solar Wall Light is powered by the sun. Just set our Solar Light at your 
desired location, and let the sun do the rest. The Triple Tier’s solar light internal Lithium Ion 
battery pack charges when sunlight hits the integrated solar panel. At sundown nine (9)  bright-
white LEDs will turn on automatically and shine at a brightness of 70 lumens and will 
provide lighting for up to 10 hours. 

Dusk to Dawn: This solar wall light is designed to provide automatic dusk-to-dawn performance 
when its battery gets fully charged during the day. This is an energy saving solution that is 
making proper use of solar energy and increases the life of the battery and lamps by operating 
the solar light from sunset to sunrise. 

Long-Lasting Reliability: Beyond providing a superior combination of light brightness and 
duration, Gama Sonic solar light fixtures are known for their physical durability. The Bollard’s 
monocrystalline solar panel is protected by weather-resistant, cleanable tempered glass that helps 
ensure long-lasting reliability. 

Do not locate the light fixture in a shaded area: Recharging speed will vary based on weather 
conditions. Please note that our solar lights require direct sun-light in order for the batteries to 
charge. 

Built to Last: At Gama Sonic, our goal is to build the world’s best solar lights by providing a 
long lasting maintenance free solar light fixture that is built to last! Every light fixture has an 
integrated Lithium Ion battery pack that is good for about 1,000 charges. The only maintenance 
required, is to change the battery every 2 ½ -3 years. That’s it! 

Full Technical Specs 
 

Model # GS-126W 



LED Color 3100K 

Lumens 70 

# of LEDs 9 

Battery Li-ion 

Voltage 3.2V 

Battery Capacity 1500 mAh 

Power Source Mono-Crystalline Solar Cell 

Solar Panel 1.6W 

Light Duration Up to 10 hours 

Measurements 9 x 11 x 10 in 

 


	Product Description
	Full Technical Specs


